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From: FOI Responses 
To:  
Subject: Freedom of Information Response 
Importance: Normal
Sensitivity: None

Dear 
 
Thank you for your Freedom of Information request dated ​​​​12th September 2024 for information about motorcycle
parking. Please find below City of Doncaster Council’s responses to the questions you have raised.
 
If questions have been asked, the question should be set out with the answer as is below:
 
Question 1: How many motorcycle areas/bays you have?
 
Response: City of Doncaster Council do not hold this information. Motorcycle bays are an area with locking points and
are various sizes, this applies across town and to on and off street parking. We do not hold a record of how many
motorcycle areas/bays there are.
Question 2: The approximate total number of bikes that can park in them? I appreciate it's not an exact science, but are
the bays a standard size (2/3 bikes) or a larger space that can accommodate 8/10
Response: City of Doncaster Council do not hold this information. Motorcycle bays are an area with locking points and
are various sizes, this applies across town and to on and off street parking. We do not hold a record of how many bikes
could use these areas as it would depend on the size of the bike.  
 
I hope that this information is useful to you.
 
City of Doncaster Council estimates that it has cost £49.00 to respond to this request for information.
 
Reviewing any decisions made:
 
 If you are not happy with this reply you can ask us to review our response. To do this write to us within 40 working days
of receiving your response at the address below or email FOIAppeals@doncaster.gov.uk 
 
If you do not agree with the review decision you can apply to the Information Commissioner’s Office (ICO) for a decision
about our compliance or otherwise with the Freedom of Information legislation. Contact details for the
ICO are: Information Commissioner’s Office, Wycliffe House, Water Lane, Wilmslow, Cheshire, SK9
5AF. www.ico.org.uk Telephone 0303 123 1113. 
 
Yours sincerely,
Sophie
 
Sophie Ormshaw
 
Information Governance Officer
Information Governance Team
Corporate Resources
City of Doncaster Council
Civic Office (Floor 2)
Waterdale
Doncaster
DN1 3BU
 



Phone: 01302 735326
E-mail: sophie.ormshaw@doncaster.gov.uk
Web: http://www.doncaster.gov.uk/
 
Please treat the content of this e-mail as confidential. If you have received this e-mail and it is not addressed to you
please accept my apologies and inform me as soon as possible.
 
 
From:  
Sent: Thursday, September 12, 2024 12:05 PM
To: Freedom of Information Requests <FOI.Requests@doncaster.gov.uk>; 
Subject: Re: Freedom of Information request response - 68795
 
H i H o p e  y o u 'r e  w e ll A s  w e  s t r iv e  f o r  c la r it y / c o n s is t e n c y ,  a r e  y o u  a b le  t o  c o n f ir m :  H o w  m a n y  m o t o r c y c le  a r e a s / b a y s  y o u  h a v e ?  T h e  a p p r o x im a t e  t o t a l n u m b e r  o f  b ik e s  t h a t  c a n  p a r k  in  t h e m ?  I  a p p r e c ia t e  it

Caution! This message was sent from outside your organization. Allow sender
s o p h o s p s m a r t b a n n e r e n d

Hi
 
Hope you're well

As we strive for clarity/consistency, are you able to confirm:

How many motorcycle areas/bays you have?
The approximate total number of bikes that can park in them? I appreciate it's not an exact science, but are the bays a
standard size (2/3 bikes) or a larger space that can accommodate 8/10

Many thanks,

ᐧ?

 
On Wed, 28 Aug 2024 at 09:37, Freedom of Information Requests <FOI.Requests@doncaster.gov.uk> wrote:

 
Thank you for your Freedom of Informat i on r equest dat ed 30 J ul y 2024 f or i nf or mat i on about  motorcyc le parki ng spac .
Please find below City of Doncaster Council’s responses to the questions you have raised.
 

1. How many off-street parking spaces there are in total in the City of Doncaster Council area. 
Response: This informat i on i s exe mpt fr o m di scl os ur e under Sect i on  ' a021 of t he Fr eed om of info rmat ion Act .  Secti o
exempts informat i on fr o m t he ' a0ri ght of access i f t hat i nf or mat i on  ' a0is r eas onably access ible to t he appl i cant  by ot h
means on our website: https://www.doncaster.gov.uk/services/transport-streets-parking/car-parking-in-doncaster

2. How many of those are motorcycle specific parking spaces.
3. How motorcycles are accommodated by the spaces listed above

Response: Motorcycle parking areas are just an area for motorcycles to use, there are no set figures on how many can park.
 

4. That data drilled down further by location.
Response: This informat i on i s exe mpt fr o m di scl os ur e under Sect i on  ' a021 of t he Fr eed om of info rmat ion Act .  Secti o
exempts informat i on fr o m t he ' a0ri ght of access i f t hat i nf or mat i on  ' a0is r eas onably access ible to t he appl i cant  by ot h



means. See on the City of Doncaster Council website the Motorcycle facility at each car park -
https://www.doncaster.gov.uk/services/transport-streets-parking/car-parking-in-doncaster
 

5. What the rules/charges are for motorcycles in the above area
Motorcycle parking is free on all car parks with motorcycle parking facility in place.
 
I hope that this information is useful to you.
 
The City of Doncaster Council estimates that it has cost £49 to respond to this request for information.
 
Reviewing any decisions made:
 
If you are not happy with this reply you can ask us to review our response. To do this write to us within 40 working days of
receiving your response at the address below or email FOIAppeals@doncaster.gov.uk 
 
If you do not agree with the review decision you can apply to the Informat i on Co mmi ssi oner’ s O ff ice ( ICO)  for a deci s
about our compliance or otherwise with the Freedom of Informat i on  l egi sl at i on .  Contac t  detai l s fo r t
ICO are: Informat i on  Co mmi ssi oner’ s  O ff ic e ,  Wyc l i f f e Hou s e, Wa ter  La n e, Wil msl ow,  Ches hi r e,
5AF. www.ico.org.uk Telephone 0303 123 1113. 
 
Ellen Dook
Information Governance Officer
Corporate Resources
City of Doncaster Council
 
Address  Civic Office, Waterdale, Doncaster, DN1 3BU
Website   www.doncaster.gov.uk
 

 
From: Freedom of Information Requests 
Sent: 30 July 2024 14:26
To: 
Subject: Freedom of Information request Acknowledgement - 
 
Dear 
 
Re:  Request for information under the Freedom of Information Act 2000
 
Thank you for your request for information.
 
I can confirm your request has been passed to the relevant department who will endeavour to search for any
information held and provide you with a response as soon as is possible. This will be within 20 working days
and in any case by the 28th August 2024.
 
Yours sincerely
 



Craig Miller
Information Governance Officer
Information Governance Team
Corporate Resources
City of Doncaster Council
 
Address Floor Two, Civic Office, Waterdale, Doncaster DN1 3BU Website www.doncaster.gov.uk
 
Follow MyDoncaster on Twitter and Facebook for the latest news
 
Please treat the content of this e-mail as confidential. If you have received this e-mail and
it is not addressed to you please accept my apologies and inform me as soon as possible.

 
 
 
From:  
Sent: 30 July 2024 11:55
To: Freedom of Information Requests <FOI.Requests@doncaster.gov.uk>
Subject: Freedom of Information request (Motorcycle Parking)
 
H i H o p e  w h o e v e r  p ic k s  t h is  u p  is  w e ll W e 'r e  d o in g  s o m e  r e s e a r c h  f o r  o n e  o f  o u r  c lie n t s  a b o u t  m o t o r c y c le  p a r k in g  s p a c e s  in  t h e  U K .  C a n  y o u  p le a s e  s u p p ly  d a t a  a r o u n d  t h e  f o llo w in g  F r e e d o m  o f  I n f o r m a t io n

s o p h o s p s m a r t b a n n e r e n d

Hi

Hope whoever picks this up is well

We're doing some research for one of our clients about motorcycle parking spaces in the UK.

Can you please supply data around the following Freedom of Information request:
  How many off-street parking spaces there are in total in the City of Doncaster Council area 
  How many of those are motorcycle specific parking spaces
  How motorcycles are accommodated by the spaces listed above
  That data drilled down further by location
  What the rules/charges are for motorcycles in the above area

Thanks,

 

 

 


